
 

役員鱐鲎鱳鱏知鲎鱠�
鲣鳣鲹鳛鱅担当鲍鲏�
★10/26鱰鲣鳣鲹鳛鱅鳢鱅鲸鱅鱳鳗鱅鲾鲛鳫鲨鲗⾏鱉鲃鱜鱤。�
★鲣鳣鲹鳛鱅活動鱰興味鱳鱇鲐⽅鱴受付鱰鱏声鱐鱖鱔鱥鱚鱉。�

福祉担当鲍鲏�
10/25 琉球鲨鳣鱅鳏鱑⾃⽴⽀援施設鲋鲆鱚鱒鲗訪問鱜�
鳇鳥鲞鲛鳫交流会鲗⾏鱉鲃鱜鱤。�
11/16�鱋鱯鱉鲨鳣鱅鳏 ⽼⼈施設訪問�
12/2 鱲鱘鲨鳣鱅鳏 障鱑鱉者鲧鳢鲱鳖鲱会鱏⼿伝鱉予定�

★10/28鲚鳁鳑鳫鲾鲛鲱鳀鳙鲿鲛鲣鳣鲳鳫鲷鱅鱳�
鳓鲱鳌鲱鳈鲮鱅鱰鱏⼿伝鱉鱰⾏鱨鱫鱒鲃鱜鱤。�
鲃鱤、OIWC鳈鲮鱅鱰鲇鱤鱔鱚鲘鱳鱙寄付鲗鱉鱤鱥鱒鲃鱜鱤。
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10⽉定例会�
10⽉定例会鱑10⽉15⽇鱰鲥鳛鳫鳏鲥鳫鲮鱅�鲭鱅鳍鲭鲜鳁鲧鳡鳎鱰鱏鱉鱫⾏鲔鲑鲃鱜鱤。

次回定例会�
12⽉定例会��

鲧鳢鲱鳖鲱鳈鲮鱅�

⽇時:12⽉3⽇(⽉)��
9時30分��

場所:�鳡鲨鳂鲤鱅鲿鳫
鳓鲾鳣



 

鲣鳣鲹鳛鱅�鲨鳣鱅鳏鱳紹介�
今⽉鱐鲎⽉鱙鱭鱰鲣鳣鲹鳛鱅鲨鳣鱅鳏鲗紹介鱜鱫鱉鱒鲃鱞。�

Foreign-side Leader   Enid Randall

This year, two former OIWC presidents are 
culture group leaders of Ryukyu culture Group. 
Reiko Shimada will serve as the Japanese side 
culture group leader and Enid Randall for the 
foreign side. Both leaders are very excited to 
have an exciting year of adventures and charity 
raising with OIWC.

Ryukyu culture group had the opportunity to 
throw a Halloween party for the high school 
students at Yumesaki. It was an opportunity to 
teach the students about the American holiday of 
Halloween. Students got a chance to do a little 
trick or treating and learn about the Legend of 
the Jack-O-Lantern. Everyone enjoyed the 
snacks and conversation! 

This week, Ryukyu culture group had their first 
culture group meeting. In honor of Halloween, 
Ryukyu culture group members wore funny wigs 
and called their meeting “Wiggin’ Out” with 
Ryukyu culture group. Members discussed their 
plans for culture group activities for the year and 
what crafts will be made for the Christmas 
bazaar. Patricia Smith (wife of Lieutenant 
General Eric M. Smith, III Marine Expeditionary 
Force; and Commander, Marine Forces Japan) 
hosted the event in her home. Ryukyu group is 
looking forward to a fun filled year! 

⽇本鲭鲜鳁鳢鱅鲸鱅 嶋⽥玲⼦�

皆様、鱘鲘鱰鱦鱴。琉球鲨鳣鱅鳏鱬鱞。�
鳑鲾鳡鳫鲗中⼼鱰新鳙鳫鳈鱅鲇加鲔鲏、�
⽇本側15名、外国側20名鱬鲱鲷鱅鳀致鱜鲃鱜鱤。�

先⽇鱴早速、福祉活動鱬「鲋鲆鱚鱒学園」鲗�
訪問鱜鲃鱜鱤。�
鳇鳥鲞鲛鳫鳉鱅鲾鲛鱅鲗通鱜鱫英語鱬鱳⾃⼰紹介鲉、
外国側鳙鳫鳈鱅鱳出⾝地鱳紹介等、�
楽鱜鱔学鱸鱯鱑鲎交流鲗深鲆鲃鱜鱤。�
⼜、12⽉鱳鲧鳢鲱鳖鲱鳈鲮鱅鱰向鱖鱫、様々鱯�
鲚鲜鲿鲛鲚鱳鲧鳡鳍鳀作鲏鲇鲱鲷鱅鳀鱜鲃鱜鱤。�

今年度鱴OIWC創⽴65周年鱬鱞。�
鱘鲑鱐鲎鲇⽇本側、鱢鱜鱫外国側鳙鳫鳈鱅鱭共鱰
国際親善鱭社会福祉活動鱰努鲆鱫鲃鱉鲏鲃鱞。�

皆様、宜鱜鱔鱏願鱉致鱜鲃鱞。�

⽇本側鳢鱅鲸鱅�
嶋⽥玲⼦

琉球鲨鳣鱅鳏�Ryukyu Group�


